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MCDONALD, MARK

From: Mark McDonald [mmcdonald1@qwest.net]
Sent:  Tuesday, July 23, 2002 12:31 PM

To: MCDONALD, MARK

Subject: Fw: Estimation for Leadership Mtg.

—-- Original Message —--

From: Kelley's Mail

To: Mark McDonald

Sent: Sunday, July 21, 2002 4:45 PM
Subject: Estimation for Leadership Mtg.

Mark,

Here is my estimation for the Leadership meeting in Chicago. DEFCON will pay for everything but they said the
policy is to have the Council's/Local's/individual's pay then be reimbursed. | found the airfare at a real good price
(86.50 r/t). Let me know what you think.

LEADERSHIP CONFERENCE AUGUST 17-22, 2002

ESTIMATION ACTUAL
AIRFARE $90.00
HOTEL 5 NTS@ 109.16 $545.80
PER DIEM 6 DAYS @ 40 PER DAY $240.00

SHUTTLE/TAXI TO/FROM AIRPORT KC & CHICAGO  $160.00

TOTAL $1,035.80

7/24/2002



